

**Bid Number: IFB 21-HR-004**

**Bid Title: Physical Exams and Drug/Alcohol Screenings**

Physical Exams		
	Occupational Health Centers of the Southwest, P.A. dba Concentra Medical Centers	Southwest Labs
Exams and Tests	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
Audio	\$ 29.00	No Bid
B-READER	\$ 105.00	No Bid
Blood Borne Pathogen Test	N/A*	No Bid
DIP UA	\$ 32.00	\$ 20.00
DOT Physical - Eye Chart, DIP UA, Titmus	\$ 91.00	No Bid
EKG	\$ 56.00	No Bid
Eye Chart/Vision	No Bid	No Bid
HPE - Human Performance Evaluation	\$ 45.00	No Bid
Ishihara	\$ 26.00	No Bid
LIPID Profile	\$ 71.00	\$ 35.00
OCC MED PANEL W/CBC & Micro UA	\$ 69.00	\$ 45.00
OSHA Questionnaire	\$ 32.00	No Bid
Physical Post Offer Exam	\$ 59.00	No Bid
PPD/TB	\$ 30.00	No Bid
Respirator fit Test	\$ 50.00	No Bid
RPR (Syphilis)	\$ 49.00	\$ 40.00
Spirometry (Pulmonary Function)	\$ 59.00	No Bid
Titmus / Titmus Peripheral	\$ 32.00	No Bid
X-RAY, CHEST, SINGLE FRONTAL 1 V	\$ 69.00	No Bid
Drug / Alcohol Screenings		
	Occupational Health Centers of the Southwest, P.A. dba Concentra Medical Centers	Southwest Labs
Exams and Tests	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
Test 1 - DOT 5 panel drug screen	\$ 51.00	No Bid
Test 2 - Breath Alcohol Test	\$ 33.00	\$ 20.00
Test 3 - NM State Police Academy Test (10 panel w/ Urine Alcohol)	\$ 51.00	\$ 39.99
Test 4 - City Standard Test	\$ 51.00	\$ 39.99
Test 5 - Anabolic Steroids	\$ 225.00	No Bid

\*Notes:

Treated as an injury under NM Fee Schedule

Bid Number: IFB 21-HR-004

Bid Title: Physical Exams and Drug/Alcohol Screenings

Bidders		Occupational Health Centers of the Southwest, P.A. dba Concentra Medical Centers	Southwest Labs	Occupational Health Centers of the Southwest, P.A. dba Concentra Medical Centers	Southwest Labs	Occupational Health Centers of the Southwest, P.A. dba Concentra Medical Centers	Southwest Labs	Estimated quantities for each Protocol per year	Occupational Health Centers of the Southwest, P.A. dba Concentra Medical Centers	Southwest Labs
Protocol Code	Protocol Name	Unit Cost for Physical Exams Only for Specified Protocol		Unit Cost for Drug/Alcohol Screen Only for Specified Protocol		Unit Cost for Entire Protocol (Physical Exams and Drug/Alcohol Screen)			Extended Cost (Multiply Unit Cost for Entire Protocol X Estimated Quantities)	
A	Police Academy (including drug screen)	\$ 350.00	No Bid	\$ 276.00	\$ 39.99	\$ 626.00	No Bid	25	\$ 15,650.00	\$ 999.75
B	ASBSUR	\$ 265.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 265.00	No Bid	2	\$ 530.00	No Bid
C	DOT--pre-employment	\$ 123.00	No Bid	\$ 51.00	No Bid	\$ 174.00	No Bid	5	\$ 870.00	No Bid
D	Hazmat	\$ 380.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 45.00	\$ 380.00	No Bid	2	\$ 760.00	\$ 90.00
E	MEDSUR	\$ 436.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 95.00	\$ 436.00	No Bid	2	\$ 872.00	\$ 190.00
F	Police Lateral Hire (includes drug screen)	\$ 271.00	No Bid	\$ 276.00	\$ 74.99	\$ 547.00	No Bid	4	\$ 2,188.00	\$ 299.96
G	Post Offer HPE-50 (includes drug screen)	\$ 197.00	No Bid	\$ 51.00	\$ 39.99	\$ 248.00	No Bid	31	\$ 7,688.00	\$ 1,239.69
H	Post Offer HPE-70 (includes drug screen)	\$ 197.00	No Bid	\$ 51.00	\$ 39.99	\$ 248.00	No Bid	5	\$ 1,240.00	\$ 199.95
I	Post Offer-Crossing Guard (includes drug screen)	\$ 120.00	No Bid	\$ 51.00	\$ 39.99	\$ 171.00	No Bid	5	\$ 855.00	\$ 199.95
J	Post Offer-Dispatcher (includes drug screen)	\$ 29.00	No Bid	\$ 51.00	\$ 39.99	\$ 80.00	No Bid	27	\$ 2,160.00	\$ 1,079.73
K	Blood-Borne Pathogen Testing	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2	No Bid	No Bid
L	DOT--Post Accident, Public Roadway, with citation	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 84.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 84.00	No Bid	2	\$ 168.00	\$ 40.00
M	DOT--Post Accident on a public Road, NO citation, -or- post accident NOT on a Public Roadway	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 84.00	No Bid	\$ 84.00	No Bid	2	\$ 168.00	No Bid
N	DOT--Random Drug Only	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 51.00	No Bid	\$ 51.00	No Bid	8	\$ 408.00	No Bid
O	DOT--Other Drug Screen	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 84.00	No Bid	\$ 84.00	No Bid	2	\$ 168.00	No Bid
P	Police Officer--Random/Mass	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 309.00	\$ 59.99	\$ 309.00	No Bid	20	\$ 6,180.00	\$ 1,199.80
Q	Police Officer--Crash/Injury/Other Drug Screen	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 84.00	\$ 59.99	\$ 84.00	No Bid	10	\$ 840.00	\$ 599.90
R	General EEs (including Temp and Seasonal)--Pre-Emp Drug Only	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 51.00	\$ 39.99	\$ 51.00	No Bid	159	\$ 8,109.00	\$ 6,358.41
S	General EEs--Random	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 84.00	\$ 59.99	\$ 84.00	No Bid	50	\$ 4,200.00	\$ 2,999.50
T	General EEs--Accident/Injury/Other Drug Screen	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 84.00	\$ 59.99	\$ 84.00	No Bid	4	\$ 336.00	\$ 239.96
U	Breath Alcohol Test only	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 33.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 33.00	No Bid	8	\$ 264.00	\$ 160.00
V	Other	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	TBD	No Bid	No Bid
W	Post Offer HPE-80 (includes drug screen)	\$ 223.00	No Bid	\$ 51.00	\$ 39.99	\$ 274.00	No Bid	8	\$ 2,192.00	\$ 319.92
X	Respirator Medical Exam & Fit Test	\$ 159.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 159.00	No Bid	2	\$ 318.00	No Bid
Y	Post Offer HPE-40 (includes drug screen)	\$ 223.00	No Bid	\$ 51.00	\$ 39.99	\$ 274.00	No Bid	28	\$ 7,672.00	\$ 1,119.72
Z	DOT Post Offer HPE-50	\$ 136.00	No Bid	\$ 51.00	No Bid	\$ 187.00	No Bid	2	\$ 374.00	No Bid
AA	General EEs- Suspicion/Other	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 84.00	\$ 59.99	\$ 84.00	No Bid	2	\$ 168.00	\$ 119.98
FA	Firefighter--Pre-employment drug screen	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 51.00	\$ 39.99	\$ 51.00	No Bid	10	\$ 510.00	\$ 399.90
FB	Firefighter--Random	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 84.00	\$ 59.99	\$ 84.00	No Bid	15	\$ 1,260.00	\$ 899.85
FC	Firefighter--Post-Accident/Other	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 84.00	\$ 59.99	\$ 84.00	No Bid	10	\$ 840.00	\$ 599.90
<b>Total Estimated Yearly Cost (Add all Extended Costs):</b>									<b>\$ 66,988.00</b>	<b>\$ 19,355.87</b>

**Bid Number: IFB 21-HR-004**

**Bid Title: Physical Exams and Drug/Alcohol Screenings**

<b>Bidder shall also provide pricing for the following items if applicable:</b>	<b>Occupational Health Centers of the Southwest, P.A. dba Concentra Medical Centers</b>	<b>Southwest Labs</b>
	<b>Unit Cost</b>	<b>Unit Cost</b>
Additional charge per employee tested for after-hours alcohol and drug screening performed between the hours of 5:00 pm and 8:00 am, and any time on a Saturday, Sunday or the vendors medical facility observed Holiday:	No Bid	\$ 199.00
Additional per technician hourly rate for on-site drug/alcohol screen services at Rio Rancho Facilities:	No Bid	\$ 20.00
Additional flat fee charge for services (excluding injury care) conducted outside the Albuquerque Metro area:	No Bid	No Bid
FMLA Evaluation:	\$ 113.00	No Bid
Return to work/fitness for duty:	\$ 96.00	No Bid

**Exceptions to the Specifications (Occupational Health Centers of the Southwest, P.A. dba Concentra Medical Centers):**

1. As current vendor, Concentra does not provide after hours or onsite Drug screen collection services.
2. BBP exposures are treated as an injury and charged at New Mexico state work comp fee schedule based on treatment plan.
3. Steroid panel cost are included under the drug/Alcohol testing.
4. For packages, B, D, E, pricing for a physical was also included in the pricing. Medical surveillance physicals must include a physical exam in addition to the testing components.

**Exceptions to the Specifications (Southwest Labs):**

None.

Posted to City of Rio Rancho website 10/19/2020