

Bid Abstract for IFB 20-UT-031

Water and Wastewater Treatment Chemicals

Bid Item	PRODUCT DESCRIPTION	UNIT OF MEASURE	ESTIMATED QUANTITY	Multi Award					Non-Award		General Non-responsive No bid received in award		General Non-responsive No bid received in award		General Non-responsive No bid received in award						
				Avista Technologies		DPC Industries		Brentang Pacific		PolyChem Inc.		Univar Solutions USA Inc.		Pencon, Inc.		Borcon Chemicals LLC		Calgary Industries, Inc.		Innovative Water Care	
UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED PRICE		
1	ChlorPro C-435B Polymer (Any Size Container or Bulk) EPA Reg. 401.10-10, 401.10-10 Residual Alkal = 1000 ppm Free Ammonia = 100000/PA US Secondary 2.0 - 3.0PH	LB	90,000	No Bid	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.35	\$ 123,000.00	No Bid	No Bid									
2	Cationic Hypochlorite (Any Size Container or Bulk) Available (Active) with 70 Min Residual Alkal = 2.5-4.5 Free Ammonia = Series 05 (Standard) Residual Alkal 200 mg/L, with 10.5 Min through 60 min, with 10.5 Min Free Ammonia = 100000/PA Free Ammonia, up to 1000 ppm at 25 Min	LB	3,000	No Bid	\$ -	\$ 1.90	\$ 5,700.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.80	\$ 5,400.00	No Bid									
3	Sodium Hypochlorite (Any Size Container or Bulk) Strength 12.5% (1%) Density 1.20 at 20°C (68°F) Freezing Point -20°F pH 11.2 - 11.6 Stability Index Physical Form: Liquid Solution Solubility in Water: Compatible	Gallons	30,000	No Bid	\$ -	\$ 1.50	\$ 45,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid										
4	Sodium Hypochlorite (Any Size Container or Bulk) Strength 10% Density 1.17 at 20°C (68°F) Freezing Point -20°F pH 11.2 - 11.6 Stability Index Physical Form: Liquid Solution Solubility in Water: Compatible	Gallons	2,000	No Bid	\$ -	\$ 1.90	\$ 3,780.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid										
5	Chloric Acid Industrial-Grade (Any Size Container or Bulk) Chloric Acid, 70% Minimum Industrial-Grade % by weight (60-100)	LB	3,500	No Bid	\$ -	\$ 1.12	\$ 3,920.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 1.05	\$ 3,710.00	No Bid									
6	Chloric Acid Industrial-Grade Liquid (Any Size Container or Bulk) Chloric Acid, 70% Minimum Industrial-Grade Chloric Acid % by weight (60-100)	LB	41,250	No Bid	\$ -	\$ 0.70	\$ 28,875.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.90	\$ 37,125.00	No Bid									
7	Sodium Sulfate Heptahydrate (Any Size Container or Bulk) US Secondary 75/24 Freezing Point: -10°C (15°F) pH: 5.0-5.5 Stability Index: 75/24 5.0-5.5	LB	9,075	No Bid	\$ -	\$ 0.28	\$ 2,541.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid										
8	Sodium Hydroxide (Any Size Container or Bulk) 50% liquid solution	LB	40,800	No Bid	\$ -	\$ 0.170	\$ 7,134.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.12	\$ 4,896.00	No Bid									
9	Block Salt (Any Size Container or Bulk) Block Salt For Use by Water and Wastewater 5-Min	LB	25,000	No Bid	\$ -	\$ 0.16	\$ 4,050.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.28	\$ 7,000.00	No Bid									
10	Partial Chlorate (Any Size Container or Bulk) US Secondary 75/24-04 Specific Gravity 1.42	LB	102,000	No Bid	\$ -	\$ 0.12	\$ 12,240.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 0.2210	\$ -									
11	D50 Calcium Sulfate Dihydrate (Any Size Container or Bulk (Delivery)) US Secondary 75/24 Specific Gravity 1.25 % Sodium, 8% Sodium, 7%	Gallons	1,590,000.00	No Bid	\$ -	\$ 1.38	\$ 2,190,000.00	\$ 2.03	\$ 3,240,000.00	No Bid	\$ 1.71	\$ 2,647,800.00									
12	20% - 20% Sulfuric Acid (Any Size Container or Bulk (Delivery)) US Secondary 75/24 Specific Gravity 1.18 % Sodium, 8% Sodium, 7%	Gallons	10,400	No Bid	\$ -	\$ 2.250	\$ 23,400.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid										
13	Antifoam V35C (Any or Equivalent) (Any Size Container or Bulk) US Secondary 75/24 Freezing Point: -10°C (15°F) pH: 5.0-5.5 Stability Index: 75/24 5.0-5.5	LB	35,000	\$ 2.63	\$ 92,050.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid										
14	Bleach 12.5% or Equivalent (Any Size Container or Bulk) Benzoyl Peroxide 12.5% US Secondary 75/24 Freezing Point: -10°C (15°F) pH: 5.0-5.5 Stability Index: 75/24 5.0-5.5	LB	1,500	\$ 4.13	\$ 6,195.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid										
15	Melchem 4212 or Equivalent Tertiary Amine, 42% Acrylic Polymer, 42% Dispersing Agent, 15%	LB	5,000	\$ 3.50	\$ 1,750.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid										
16	Sodium Hydroxide 10% (Any Size Container or Bulk) US Secondary 75/24 Freezing Point: -10°C (15°F) pH: 5.0-5.5 Stability Index: 75/24 5.0-5.5	LB	1,800	\$ 3.87	\$ 6,966.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid										
17	Bleach P12 or Equivalent (Any Size Container or Bulk) Benzoyl Peroxide 12% US Secondary 75/24 Freezing Point: -10°C (15°F) pH: 5.0-5.5 Stability Index: 75/24 5.0-5.5	LB	1,800	\$ 3.66	\$ 6,588.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid										
18	Hydrogen Peroxide (Any Size Container or Bulk) Available (Active) with 10 Min Residual Alkal = 2.5-4.5 Free Ammonia = Series 05 (Standard) Residual Alkal 200 mg/L, with 10.5 Min through 60 min, with 10.5 Min Free Ammonia = 100000/PA Free Ammonia, up to 1000 ppm at 25 Min	LB	100,000	No Bid	\$ 0.18	\$ 18,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid										
19	Expendable or Equivalent (Super Sack 2000Lbs) (Any Size Container or Bulk)	10	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid										
20	Fuel Charge (If Any)	Delivery	1	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -												
21	Delivery Charge (If Any)	Delivery	1	N/A	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	\$ -												
Contracted Bid Total (Items 1-20)					\$ 58,578.00		\$ 2,271,111.00		\$ 3,045,000.00		\$ 112,500.00		\$ 2,715,226.00								
MM Standard Contractor Preference 0%				No Certificate	\$ -	Certificate Provided	\$ 113,525.00	No Certificate	\$ -	No Certificate	\$ -	No Certificate	\$ -								
Total Amount with Preference applied for Evaluation/Purposes Only					\$ 58,578.00		\$ 2,387,636.00		\$ 3,045,000.00		\$ 112,500.00		\$ 2,715,226.00								
Bid Item #13 - 2,500 Tons Min Bid Item #14 - 100,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #15 - 100,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #17 - 500,000 Gallons Min		Bid Item #20 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #21 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #22 - 1,000 Gallons Min		Bid Item #23 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #24 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #25 - 1,000 Gallons Min		Bid Item #26 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #27 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #28 - 1,000 Gallons Min		Bid Item #29 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #30 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #31 - 1,000 Gallons Min		Bid Item #32 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #33 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #34 - 1,000 Gallons Min		Bid Item #35 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #36 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #37 - 1,000 Gallons Min		Bid Item #38 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #39 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #40 - 1,000 Gallons Min		Bid Item #41 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #42 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #43 - 1,000 Gallons Min		Bid Item #44 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #45 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #46 - 1,000 Gallons Min		Bid Item #47 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #48 - 1,000 Gallons Min Bid Item #49 - 1,000 Gallons Min	